
”

“

there's a secret answer. So they'll react to
music emotionally but not be able to
articulate why. That's the missing link,
that's what you hope to fill in, to get
people used to listening all the way
through a song, so they're able to
understand their reaction to it."

Getting people to listen is at the core of
what Horachek does. Lyrics are the heart
and soul of her music. She believes in the
songwriter as storyteller. 

"You pull out everyday banal images that
serve to set a scene that audiences can
connect with. Vocals are upfront, you can
hear the words and you use
instrumentation to flavour the story. If
you're a songwriter, you want your story,
your vocals, your mood to come across."

Still, after swimming against the Top 40
current, Horachek says she has finally
started to accept that "in some music, the
lyrics simply aren't important - and they're
not meant to be important. Feeling is
more important than content."

“I'm shaking 
my tail with

everybody who's
trying to be

different just like
me. We're after
the same brand 

of individuality.”
That's quite a concession. Real life has a
way of opening your eyes to more than
your own opinion. Horachek has spent her
fair share of time staring out the car
window on long drives between gigs. She
has played every kind of venue, from
coffee houses where the audiences are
enthused and attentive, to bars where the
patrons are ... not. 

"I remember, one time, I showed up to
play a gig in Calgary and I was singing
into a microphone duct-taped to a
broomstick anchored in a milk crate. And

the mic cord ran across this table of six
women, who were drinking and having a
good time and not at all interested in me."

She played through. "You just have to tell
yourself, okay, not a good night. It's
humbling, but it's part of your growth." 

One of Horachek's strengths is the ability
to shrug off the not-so-good nights and
focus forward. Right now, she's thinking
about her next album. She's also staying
involved behind the scenes. She's just
finished serving two years on the board of
the Saskatchewan Recording Industry
Association (SRIA), including six months
as president, and she's currently on the
national advisory board for the Foundation
to Assist Canadian Talent on Record
(FACTOR). On her website, she's posted
a call for support for FACTOR. 

For Horachek, advocacy and support are
vital to the survival of the Canadian music
industry. "I know it's hard sometimes for
some people to justify tax dollars going to
things like art and music and culture, but I
think the first thing that's forgotten is the
huge economic impact of these industries.
The kind of dollars we've brought into the
province through federal grants that get
spent in Saskatchewan - on recording
studios, graphic arts, photography - it's all
money that gets invested back into the
community," she says. 

With much of her energy going into
teaching and industry advocacy, is
Horachek afraid she'll lose her focus on
the music? Not a bit. "I like the fact that
there's something else contributing to my
music. You can get too caught up in the
criticism and image, because your living
depends on it. But it's way more fun when
you can just go out there and blow off
steam.

"There is tremendous opportunity for solo
artists in Canada right now. Now is the
time, it really is. Audiences are getting
overwhelmed with the flash and glitter of
commercial music, they're looking for
something more authentic."

Authentic. It's the calling card of a new
generation of female singer/songwriters,
and it's Carrie Horachek's brand. 
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Preferences, dislikes and little quirks are
often evident in landscaping choices. My
own personal quirk, when it comes to
plants, is that if I can’t eat them I’m not
interested in caring for them. My potted
herb selection reflects that.

Whether you’re updating your yard or
considering a radical change, here are
expert tips on putting a personal stamp
on your outdoor space.

Think of Your Yard as
an Outdoor Room
Megan Payne of Wilson’s Greenhouse
and Garden Centre points out that if you
think of your yard as an extension of your
home, you may find it easier to imagine
creative changes or additions. You use
your kitchen for cooking, your TV room
for watching TV, your bedroom for
sleeping – what do you want to do in
your backyard? If your answer is sleep,
plant trees to hang a hammock or design
around your existing hammock tree to
make it more private. If you want to
entertain, design a deck that’s big enough
to hold 20 guests. If you want to relax in
beautiful and fragrant surroundings,
install garden paths and benches, plant
flowers and consider raised beds for
growing vegetables.

Look at the Big Picture
Landscape experts take cues from their
clients’ homes when making
recommendations. Neil Robinson of

Garden Architecture and Design walks
through both house and yard to get an
overall feel for the type of surroundings a
client prefers. He makes suggestions
based on his observations. You can do the
same thing by asking yourself some basic
questions.

First, take a look at aesthetics. From a
beauty standpoint, looking at the big
picture involves determining how you
want to use your backyard. Do you want
a secluded reading spot or your own
holiday area at home? Do you want to
host neighbourhood barbecues or suntan
on your deck? Industry trends show that
many people are looking for more privacy
than the traditional raised deck provides.
They want shade, quiet and a relaxing
outdoor area away from neighbours’ eyes.
Some homeowners want more than one
deck, each with different functions. Once
you know what you want, you can
organize your outdoor spaces to meet
your needs.

Second, look at functionality, particularly
water flow. Is the area around your home
properly drained? If soil angles toward
your house, rather than away from it,
moisture in your yard will flow toward
your home and eventually damage the
foundation. That can lead to damp
basements and unhealthy indoor
environments – primarily from mould. It
can cost thousands of dollars in
improvements simply to maintain your
property value. 

According to James Polley at Allan’s
Landscaping, Ltd. dealing with water
flow problems to prevent potentially
devastating problems in both new and
older homes is a common part of the job.
Redirecting roof drainage can be part of
the treatment. Proper landscaping
prevents water draining along house
foundations, channelling it instead to
areas of your yard that need water. Also,
soil built up around your home acts as an
insulator – 30% of heat is lost through
basements. Combined with a proper
slope away from your home, your
basement will stay warmer and drier. 

Landscape consultants
can integrate time and
cost saving devices into
new and redone yard

designs. Directing slopes
toward tree roots,

for example, can give
your trees extra water
every time it rains… 
without your having

to lift a finger.

Like home decor, your yard, garden or patio can be an
extension of your personality and lifestyle. 

story by Noelle Chorney



Budget Your Time 
AND Money 
Polley recommends deciding how much
time you want to spend building and
maintaining your yard. This will help
determine how involved a landscaper will
be. Ask for a consultation based on your
needs. Hire someone to do the hard
landscaping, such as building beds and
laying topsoil, and do the rest yourself.
Or sit back and let them do the whole
thing. Just sign on the dotted line. 

The amount of money you spend will
also determine the amount of work you
do yourself. For maximum results

spending as little as possible, prepare to
invest in sweat equity. A nice balance is to
plan the work in phases. Landscaping
consultants commonly create phased
designs that can be built over several
years. 

Short Term Effort,
Long Term Gain
What’s your take on maintenance over
the long term? Do you want to do the
minimum and get out of there? Do you
love cutting grass? How much access to
water do you have? These questions will
determine how much money and effort
you put into your yard at the outset. 

Grass is one of the fastest and cheapest
landscape elements to install. Over the
long term, however, it is maintenance
intensive. It requires aeration, adequate
water, mowing and fertilization to look

green and lush. Other options may cost
more up front but will require less effort
to maintain down the road – leaving you
more time to enjoy your yard.

One long-term low maintenance
approach is xeriscaping, the practice of
using drought tolerant and hardy plants
in landscape design. By blending these
plants with moisture-conserving mulches,
you can have a beautiful and low-
maintenance yard with little effort.
Xeriscaped yards require a little more
planning and therefore cost a little more
up front. Landscape designers will need
to know how you plan to use your yard,
if you need a grassy area for the kids to
play on, for example. You can still have
grass, but by surrounding it with less
demanding plants the upkeep will be
minimal.

Finishing Touches
Once you’ve worked out how your yard
will look and function, add the personal
touches. Local greenhouses employ
knowledgeable staff who can help with
everything from a single flowerbed to the
full meal deal. Megan Payne has these
tips. 

Beyond Garden Gnomes. Garden
accessories are becoming more and more
sophisticated. Mix them in pathways
among foliage, add a chair or bench in a
secluded spot or place a gazing ball in a
prominent part of your garden.

Just Add Water. Yards don’t have to be
all about decks and plants. Focal points
such as ponds and water fountains are
popular too. Whether you have a
consultant plan and build it, or take a
class at your local greenhouse and do it
yourself, a bubbling spring can provide
hours of pleasure with minimal
maintenance. 

Contain Yourself. If you choose low
maintenance perennials for your yard,
brighten up your deck and focal points
with container gardening. Potted plants
are a great way to add colour without too
much water or upkeep. And don’t
confine yourself to plants in those
planters. Remember the water fountain -
try that in a pot! 
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Imagine having someone help you with the cost of unexpected
drug bills. Saskatchewan Blue Cross provides coverage for
prescription drugs, as well as dental services, emergency
ambulance services, registered therapists and health practitioners,
and a wide range of other medical expenses. It helps you and
your family when you need it the most. Visit your local
Saskatchewan Blue Cross Insurance Broker or contact us today.

Call 1-800-USE-BLUE (873-2583) 
or visit www.sk.bluecross.ca

® Registered trade-mark of the Canadian Association of Blue Cross Plans, used under license by Medical Services Incorporated, an independent licensee.


